
VILLAGE OF CHATHAM, ILLINOIS 

ORDINANCE NO. 11 - 71 
AN ORDINANCE APPROVING BID FOR FIXED POLE 
MOUNTED AND AUTO POLE MOUNTED CAPACITORS 

ADOPTED BY THE PRESIDENT AND BOARD OF TRUSTEES OF THE VILLAGE OF 
CHATHAM, ILLINOIS THIS 13TH DAY OF SEPTEMBER, 2011 

Published in pamphlet form by the authority of the President and 
Board of Trustees of the Village of Chatham, Sangamon County, 
Illinois, this 13th day of September, 2011. 



ORDINANCE NO. 11- .1 c:; 

AN ORDINANCE APPROVING BID FOR FIXED POLE 
MOUNTED AND AUTO POLE MOUNTED CAPACITORS 

WHEREAS, the Village of Chatham sought and obtained bids for 

Substation, Fixed Pole Mounted, and Auto Pole Mounted Capacitors; 

and 

WHEREAS, the bids were opened and the lowest responsible 

bidder identified as HD Supply for Fixed Pole Mounted Capacitor of 

$6,608.00 and Auto Pole Mounted Capacitors of $30,781.00. Bids for 

Substation Capacitors were rejected. 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE PRESIDENT AND BOARD OF 

TRUSTEES OF THE VILLAGE OF CHATHAM, ILLINOIS, AS FOLLOWS: ' 

SECTION 1: That the bid from HD Supply is hereby approved and 

the Village Manager is hereby directed to complete the necessary 

documents. 

SECTION 2: This Ordinance is effective upon its passage and 

approval. 

PASSED THIS 13TH DAY OF SEPTEMBER, 2011 

Thomas S. Gray, Pre 
Village of Chatham 
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ABSENT: ~O~· ______________________________ __ 
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ORDINANCE CERTIFICATE 

STATE OF ILLINOIS 
SS. 

COUNTY OF SANGAMON 

I, the undersigned, do hereby certify that I am the duly 

qualified and acting Village Clerk of the Village of Chatham, 

Sangamon County, Illinois. 

I do further certify that the Ordinance attached hereto is a 

full, true, and exact copy of Ordinance No. 11 - Jt, adopted by 

the President and Board of Trustees of said Village on the 13 th day 

of September, 2011, said Ordinance being entitled: 

AN ORDINANCE APPROVING BID FOR FIXED POLE 
MOUNTED AND AUTO POLE MOUNTED CAPACITORS 

I do further certify that prior to the making of this 

certificate, the said Ordinance was spread at length upon the 

permanent records of said Village, where it now appears and 

remains. 

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, I have hereunto set my hand and affixed 

the official seal of said Village this 13 th day of September, 2011. 

Schad, Village Clerk 



i3f-11RN~~f IHIENRY f 
i\I\I:iS\llNIHIEiM(!lR & GENDill, iNC. 
Engineers ServIng lv1unlc1paUtlss and UtilitIes 

July 11, 2011 

Mr. Shane Hill 
Village of Chatham, IL 
116 E. Mulberry 
Chatham, IL 62629 

Ref: Municipal Electric Utility 
Capacitor Bid Results 
B1338 K001 

Dear Mr. Hill: 

On June 20, 2011, the Village opened bids for the substation and pole mounted capacitor banks. 
The Village received five (5) bids for the project. The bid results were as follows: 

Bidder 
HDSupply 
Fletcher 
Brownstown(1) 
Brownstown(2) 
Controllix 
Electrorep 

Substation 
no bid 
$156,240.00 
$145,950.00 
$181,650.00 
$131,642.00 
no bid 

FIXed Pole Mounted 
$6,608.00 
$7,240.00 
$9,836.40 
$19786.20 
no bid 
$18,536.80 

Auto Pole Mounted 
$30,781.00 
$37,528.00 
$32,634.00 
$31,714.20 
no bid 
$39,229.92 

The substation capacitor bank bids were vague at best. After receiving more information we have 
. concluded that the low bidder for the substation capacitor bank\met the specifications. 

Additional information was also received from the low bidder for the pole mounted capacitor banks 
and we determined that their bid met the specifications. 

We recommend awarding the two (2) substation capacitor banks to Controllix Corporation based on 
the low bid of $131,642. We also recommend awarding the pole mounted capacitor banks to HD 
Supply based on the low bid of $37,389. 

Should you have any questions, please call me. We have made copies of the bids you mailed to us 
and we are returning them with this correspondence. Please note we received two (2) cashiers 
checks (for bid security) with the bid documents you sent to us and we are returning them with the 
bids. 

Sincerely, 
BHMG Engineers, Inc. 

Verbal J. Blakey, P.E. 
Vice President 

Enclosure 
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